

BID RECAP

WASHINGTON STATE FERRIES												
EDMONDS FERRY TERMINAL												
PILE CAP REPAIR												
D45531												
Eng Est												
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	QUAN	UNIT	UNIT PRICE	AMOUNT	UNIT PRICE	AMOUNT	UNIT PRICE	AMOUNT	UNIT PRICE	AMOUNT	UNIT PRICE
1	Mobilization	1	L.S.	6,500.00	6,500.00	5,000.00	5,000.00					
2	Pile Cap Repair	1	L.S.	5,200.00	5,200.00	8,000.00	8,000.00					
3	SPCC Plan	1	L.S.	200.00	200.00	500.00	500.00					
CONTRACT TOTAL					11,900.00	13,500.00	13,500.00		No Bid		No Bid	
PERCENTAGE DIFFERENCE												
Note: All bidders were called on October 27, 2005 as a follow up to ascertain they had rec												

BID RECAP

CAICOS Corporation		Manson Construction		
	UNIT		UNIT	
AMOUNT	PRICE	AMOUNT	PRICE	AMOUNT
No Bid		No Bid		
gived the RFP and they chose not to bid for various reasons.				